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CHILD WELFARE IN CALIFORNIA

Facts At A Glance

• More than 700,000 children come into contact with California’s child welfare system annually.1

•  On any given day, more than 175,000 children are in contact with the child welfare system.2

•  More than 86,000 children are in foster care in 2004.  That compares to 108,000 children who were in 
foster care in 2000.2

•  Of the children in foster care, about 19,000 will reunify with their parents and 8,000 will be adopted 
during the course of a year.2

•  Most children entering foster care (76%) were removed from their homes for neglect-related reasons.2

•  Of children who enter foster care, more than 50% are age 5 or under.2

•  Every year, California county child welfare agencies receive more than one-half million reports of 
suspected child abuse and neglect.  Of these referrals, the vast majority of the cases receive no 
services, despite assessments that indicate families would benefit from services and support to 
prevent child abuse and neglect.3

•  Approximately one-third of telephone hotline referrals are re-referrals of the same families from the 
previous year.4

•  Many children cycle through the foster care system more than once and experience multiple 
placements.  Of the children who entered foster care in 2000 and remained in care   for 12 months, 
35% experienced three or more placements.5

•  Out of all children who first entered foster care in 1998, about 57% were reunified, 16% were adopted 
and 10% were still in care five years after coming into care.5

•  About 51% of children in foster care in California have been in care for over two years. As these 
children remain longer in care, their likelihood of being reunified decreases, thus requiring that other 
forms of permanency be explored (i.e., adoption, legal guardianship).5

•  In recent years, about 40% of all children first entering foster care in California live primarily in a 
relative care placement.  These children are more likely to be placed with their siblings, less likely 
to have multiple foster care placements and more likely to maintain their living situation and family 
relationships when they turn 18 than children who are placed with non-relatives.5

•  The federal system for funding child welfare services at the state and county levels provides open-
ended funding for children and youth who are in foster care, but caps funds for prevention and early 
intervention efforts.  These funding restrictions result in the states and counties having significantly 
more funds available for placing children into out-of-home care - as opposed to funding programs that 
could reduce the need for child welfare services in the first place.
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•  National and other studies show that of youth who emancipate from foster care:

•  75% work below grade level6

•  46% do not complete high school7

•  51% are unemployed7

•  10 to 25% are homeless7

• In 2002, 7% of California’s children were African American, but this group constituted 29% of the 
children under child welfare services jurisdiction and 33% of the children in supervised out-of-home 
care.8

•  Conservative estimates of the cost of abuse and neglect to U.S. society each year are staggering:  
$25 billion in direct costs (i.e., hospitalization, mental health treatment, and police services) is 
compounded by $69 billion for indirect costs such as juvenile delinquency, adult criminality and lost 
productivity to society.9

•  African American children in California are more likely than white or Latino children to be reported 
for abuse and, if they are reported, are more likely to be placed in foster care, particularly if they are 
infants. They also are less likely to be reunified and adopted than children of other races.10
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